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About This Game

From the creative mind behind The Adventures of Shuggy comes an exciting new retro-styled 2D platformer, a winner of
Dream Build Play 2012 and a top 50 game of 2012 accordi 5d3b920ae0
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This is a brilliant, gem of a game. Buy it right now! It might seem like a 2D Portal from the screenshots, but it is not, it is a lot,
lot more. HIGHLY recommended.. Very nice puzzle game. The puzzles are challenging (sometimes so much that I'm really
grateful to the developer for including the purchasable solutions), the controls work fine and the art stile is not bad. What I don't
like about it is that it depends heavily on upgrades, a ton of the areas are locked at the beginning and can only be reached as you
slowly get the various guns and upgrades that allow you to solve the puzzles that lead to those areas. I bought this game because I
assumed it would have been a 2d version of portal, and at the beginning it was. But portal's low skill floor was the thing that
made it such an awesome game: you had one simple tool with 2 modes and you had to master them. As you progressed through
the game the levels became more and more difficult, but the tools you had stayed the same, which allowed it to be a game with
huge depth with very little complexity. Something that this game is sadly not. But it's still enjoyable, for a few hours. At 0.99 it's
a no brainer.. I've played worse 2D retro pixel platformers. This one is basically a 2D portal ripoff. There's a little bit of skill
based platforming and jumping on monsters heads, but mostly it's about puzzle solving. I think the developers behind the game
are quite talented, Shuggy was also one of the better 2D retro pixel platformers, but it's a complete waste of a good developer to
keep doing 2D retro pixel platformers. Overall the game is complete and fairly well polished, the graphics are pretty average but
better than most pixel games.. Gateways has a decent concept, sort of in the vein of those Portalesque games that followed in it's
wake, but a reasonably decent game. Although, unfortunately, I wasn't able to finish the game. The puzzle design has some of
the most difficult puzzles in the game being mandatory to complete, which wouldn't be a problem normally. But, the mechanic
you unlock near the end of the game that enables these puzzles involves a lot of key timing and platforming that ended up being
far too twitchy for me to finish. Ultimately, because I have no 'maybe' option, I have to vote No on Gateways because of this.
Perhaps if they had structured the game a little differently I could recommend it. But sadly, if any of what I mentioned seems
like a red flag for you, I'd look elsewhere.. This game is like Portal X50. Soon as I got to the time manipulation the game got a
bit confusing. I'll likely play with it some more later but so far I love the game.
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